
12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

TN0330100

7328 Shallowford Rd16-123347 12/5/2016   4:09:00PM Miscellaneous

Upon arrival, police spoke with Rebecca Collett. Ms Collett stated that while she was filing out her online paperwork at Zaxby's her 
card balance showed 1 Billion dollars. When she went back in to check it the money was gone. Ms Collett never had any money on
a card for Zaxby's. Ms Collett just wanted to report it. D-2/R-57

7014 SHALLOWFORD ROAD16-124317 12/4/2016   4:15:00PM 23H ALL OTHER LARCENY

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         NO

206 Haney Dr16-124897 12/4/2016   3:32:00AM 290 DESTRUCTIVE/DAMAGE/VANDA

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         NO

510  Central DR16-124910 12/4/2016   4:56:00AM 23D   THEFT FROM BUILDINGS

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         NO

6114 Dayton Blvd.16-124933 12/4/2016   8:08:00AM Miscellaneous

On Sunday, 120416 at approx. 0808hrs., I responded to 6114 Dayton Blvd., Landscapes to go, to what appeared to be a vandalism
call. Upon my arrival I had try to locate a responcible, but they could not locate anyone to take the vandalism report.
D2/R51

1610 Starboard Dr16-124981 12/4/2016  12:30:00AM 290 DESTRUCTIVE/DAMAGE/VANDA



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         NO

1944  Northpoint BLVD16-125025 12/4/2016   1:45:00PM 23C SHOPLIFTING

On Sunday, 120416 at approx. 1412hrs., I responded to 1944 Northpoint Blvd., Home Depot, to a shoplifting call. Upon my arrival I 
met w / Shawn Tyler, Loss Prevention, who stated both Erica V. King and Kiesha Miller were observed selecting the listed 
merchandise and concealing it in a large purse. Both parties then passed all points of sale and left the store w/o paying for the 
merchandise. They were then detained and charged w / Theft under $500.00.
The merchandise was recovered which valued $367.97
D9/R51

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

1816 Gunbarrel Rd16-125051 12/4/2016   4:02:00PM 23C SHOPLIFTING

On 12/4/16 at approx. 1602 hrs, Officers responded to 1816 Gunbarrel Road (Target) to a shop lifter. Upon arrival, Officers spoke 
to Dakota Stinnett (lp) who said he observed a white male grab a jacket from inside of the store and put it on. He said the male 
also put on gloves and other merchandise. He said as the male was walking out of the store with out paying for the items he 
confronted him. He said he was able to get the jacket off, but unable to get the rest of the merchandise. He said the male ran 
towards Golden Corral and got into a yellow vehicle. The suspect is a white male, brown hair, wearing blue jeans and white shoes. 
The items stolen were an estimated $110.00.

D1/R08 Charlie 8

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

7430 Shallowford Rd.16-125055 12/4/2016   1:50:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

7610 East Brainerd Rd16-125068 12/4/2016   5:06:00PM Miscellaneous

On 12/4/2016 at 1706 hours, I, Ofc. Janow #935 responded to 7610 East Brainerd Rd for a call at the post office. An anonymous 
caller said she had been to the post office and noticed a couple of mailboxes were open. Police went to check and boxes 21375 
and 21524 were open. They appeared to possibly have damage to the piece that locks them, but no responsible could be reached 
to confirm if they were damaged maliciously, or were open for a reason. There is nothing more that can be done at this point until 
employees return and can verify the boxes have been damaged. 

R57/D2(Charlie 8)



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

5440 Hwy 15316-125072 12/4/2016  11:50:00AM 23D THEFT FROM BUILDINGS

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

6114 Dayton BLVD16-125075 12/4/2016   1:00:00PM 240 MOTOR VEHICLE THEFT

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

7014  McCutcheon RD16-125076 12/4/2016   5:53:00PM 13B SIMPLE ASSAULT

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         NO

2103 E 26th St16-125077 12/4/2016   5:50:00PM 290 DESTRUCTIVE/DAMAGE/VANDA

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         no

490 Greenwayview DR16-125081 12/4/2016   6:00:00PM 23C SHOPLIFTING

On 12/4/2016 at approximately 1820 hours, police responded to Walmart at 490 Greenwayview Dr. in response to a report of a 
shoplifter.

Upon arrival, police met with the complainant, Brian Scott, who works in the Loss Prevention office.  Mr. Scott observed the 
suspect selecting and concealing merchandise before passing all points of sale without any attempt to pay for the merchandise.  
Suspect was issued a misdemeanor citation and banned from the premises.

D1 D9/R54

Charlie South

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

930 Douglas St16-125087 12/4/2016   6:37:00PM 290 DESTRUCTIVE/DAMAGE/VANDA

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

2277 Gunbarrel RD16-125092 12/4/2016  10:00:00AM 23G THEFT OF MOTOR VEHICLE PAR

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         NO

7022  Shallowford RD16-125118 12/4/2016   1:58:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         NO

55 JOHNSON ST16-125130 12/4/2016   6:00:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         NO

1804 Ocoee St16-125178 12/5/2016   3:00:00AM Miscellaneous

On 12/5/2016 at 0300hrs. I, Officer Stewart, responded to a disorder at 1804 Ocoee St. Upon arrival police were met by Tiffany 
Bell  and Arlantis Jones . Ms. Bell stated that she and Mr. Jones were involved in a verbal dispute. 
Ms. Bell stated that Mr. Jones broke the glass out of the storm door to the front of the house when he slammed the door. Police did
see a broke glass storm door. Mr. Jones did state to police that he did slam the door, but that he did not mean to break the glass. 
Both Ms. Bell and Mr. Jones reside at this residence. Mr. Jones stated that he would go to his mother’s house for the rest of the 
night. Mr. Jones left the scene without further incident. No further information at this time.

D2/R55

2463 Bridge Cir.16-125182 12/5/2016   4:00:00AM Miscellaneous

On December 5, 2016 at approximately 0418 hours, I, Officer Ryan Lynn Badge #999 EMP #73508, responded to the report of a 
disorder prevention at 2463 Bridge Cir. Apt. 302.
   Upon arrival, I was met by Denise Eller. Denise stated that her daughter owed a male party money. Denise stated that the male 
party, “Josh,” was coming to her residence to talk about her daughter’s debt. Denise showed me the text message where he was 
supposed to be there in 20 minutes. I stayed on scene an hour pass the time he was supposed to arrive, but he never showed up. 
Denise did not know the “Josh” party or where her daughter was at to discuss the issues. The call was closed with no further police
action needed at this time.

D-2 / R-57 Charlie 9

256 W 37th St16-125187 12/5/2016   5:42:00AM Miscellaneous



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

Mr. Bernard Hyter came outside this morning to go to work and found a man sleeping in the back seat of his car. The man said he 
thought he was in his girlfriend's car and the doors were open. Mr. Hyter said it looked like the man had been sleeping there all 
night but that nothing was taken from the car. The man could not be located.

R53/D2

1881 Clearbrook Court16-125201 12/5/2016   7:00:00AM Damaged Property Accidental

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

2731 Haywood Ave16-125249 12/4/2016  11:00:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

4850 Hwy 5816-125259 12/5/2016  10:30:00AM 23C SHOPLIFTING

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

7245 E Brainerd Rd16-125260 12/4/2016   9:00:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

On 05 Dec. 2016, I, PST Glenn, responded via telephone to 7245 E. Brainerd Rd. #102, on report of a vehicle break in.  I spoke 
with Candace Winsett, the victim.  She says that she left her 2016 Ford Mustang unlocked and at some point between 2100 and 
2330 hours last evening, an unknown party entered her vehicle and stole her Taurus 380 Curve serial # 06635F, pick and gray in 
color. 

She stated that there was no damage to her vehicle and nothing else taken that she is currently aware of.

The firearm was entered into NCIC by G. Cook, assigning # G543941665.

R57/D1

status: suspended/inactive.

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

2040 Hamilton Place Blvd.16-125283 12/5/2016  12:50:00PM 23D THEFT FROM BUILDINGS



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

5929 Hwy 15316-125315 12/5/2016   3:00:00PM Miscellaneous

On 12-05-2016 at 1508 hours police responded to the parking lot of Academy Sports at 5929 Hwy 153 to back up EMS on a call 
where parties were unconscious in their vehicle.
    Lakisha Banther W/F  and Celena Paris W/F  were just sleeping and stated that they were okay.
    No further police action.

D2 R51

490 Greenway View Dr.16-125356 12/5/2016   4:20:00PM 23C SHOPLIFTING

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

2204  Hamilton Place BLVD16-125368 12/4/2016   4:30:00PM 23G THEFT OF MOTOR VEHICLE PAR

The victim (Victor Hernandez) said that he last saw the license plate  attached to his car (1996 Chevy S14, pkup truck) 
when he parked it at work (El Meson, 2204 Hamilton Place Blvd)  last night at about 4:30 pm.  The car then stayed parked there 
until he got off work at about 11  pm and then he later discovered that the plate was gone when he got home at about 11:30 pm.  
This report was taken by phone.  Case status is inactive.  Nic# P696119804.    Date: 12/5/16, Time: 16:37.  R57, D1

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

4510 Rossville Blvd16-125369 12/5/2016   4:30:00PM 240 MOTOR VEHICLE THEFT

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

6148  Lee HWY16-125370 12/5/2016  12:00:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

640 E Crest Rd16-125371 12/5/2016   4:30:00PM Harassment All Others



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         No

7641  Lee HWY16-125373 12/5/2016   3:00:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

1007 ASHLAND TER16-125383 12/5/2016   4:00:00PM 240 MOTOR VEHICLE THEFT

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

751 Runyan Dr16-125390 12/4/2016  10:00:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

5117 Hwy 15316-125397 12/5/2016   3:00:00PM Harassment All Others

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         no

25 S Germantown Rd16-125405 12/5/2016   6:05:00PM 13B SIMPLE ASSAULT

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         no

325 Tremont St16-125407 12/4/2016   6:00:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

1001 S. Kelley St.16-125420 12/5/2016   6:31:00PM Miscellaneous

On December 5th, 2016 at 1831, I, Ofc. Deleon #620, responded to 1001  S. Kelly St. on regards of a disorder call. I arrived on 
scene and spoke with Shannon Johnson and claimed that her boyfriend, Gregory Gillespie, threatened and harrassed her. Ms. 
Johnson is known by police and was highly intoxicated at that time speaking with me. I adivsed Ms. Johnson to stay from Mr. 
Gillespie and call police if Mr. Gillespie were to come to her residence. 
D2,R56

1714 Jenkins Road16-125422 12/5/2016   6:37:00PM Miscellaneous

On 12/5/16 at 6:37pm police responded to a Disorder at 1714 Jenkins Road. Upon arrival police spoke with Josh Nation and 
Andrea Proesch. They said they wanted their parents to leave. The parents were all standing on the front porch. Police told 
everyone to leave and they complied. Nothing further.

R57/D2 Charlie 8

5820 Lee HWY16-125423 12/4/2016  10:00:00PM 240 MOTOR VEHICLE THEFT

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

8467 East Brainerd RD16-125437 12/4/2016  10:50:00PM 23H ALL OTHER LARCENY

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

975 Beason Dr.16-125438 12/5/2016   5:15:00PM RUNAWAY

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         No

26 E Main St16-125447 12/4/2016   8:30:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

4758 Hwy 5816-125449 12/5/2016   7:38:00PM 13A AGGRAVATED ASSAULT

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         No



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         No

3901 Rossville Blvd16-125452 12/5/2016   6:30:00PM 290 DESTRUCTIVE/DAMAGE/VANDA

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

975 Beason Dr16-125459 12/5/2016   5:15:00PM 13B SIMPLE ASSAULT

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         No

3207  Hoyt ST16-125491 12/5/2016   4:00:00PM 290 DESTRUCTIVE/DAMAGE/VANDA

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         Yes

1000 Hixson Pike16-125492 12/5/2016   9:27:00PM 290 DESTRUCTIVE/DAMAGE/VANDA

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

1992 Acer Cir16-125532 12/6/2016   1:38:00AM 290 DESTRUCTIVE/DAMAGE/VANDA

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         yes

1312 E 36th St16-125540 12/6/2016   2:17:00AM 13A AGGRAVATED ASSAULT



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         no

3221 SOCIAL CIR16-125579 12/5/2016  10:20:00PM 240 MOTOR VEHICLE THEFT

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

7707 Lee Hwy16-125596 12/6/2016   9:00:00AM Miscellaneous

Upon arrival, police spoke with Hotel staff about a window that got damaged. Police went and talked with the resident in the room 
Juliette Moss. Ms Moss stated that she was going to take care of the damage. The Hotel agreed and did not wish to make a report.
D-2/R-57

1008 S Greenwood AVE16-125599 12/5/2016   8:00:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         NO

5764 Highwy 15316-125600 12/5/2016  10:00:00AM Miscellaneous

On 06 Dec. 2016, I, PST Glenn, responded via telephone to Walmart at 5764 Highway 153., on report of credit card fraud.

I spoke to card holder Jill Pool.  She says that sometime on 05 Dec. 2016, an unknown party used her Discover card information to
make a charge of $151.07.  She says that she has talked to Discover and they have reversed the charge and she has not suffered 
a loss due to this action.  Mrs. Pool says that Discover has also cancelled that card number and issued a replacement.

Mrs. Pool understands that this is a miscellaneous report as she is not a victim.

2100 HAMILTON PL16-125616 12/6/2016  10:00:00AM 23H ALL OTHER LARCENY

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         NO

1874 Clear Brook CT16-125657 12/5/2016   7:30:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

On 06 Dec. 2016, I, PST Glenn, responded via telephone to 1874 Clear Brook Ct., on report of a theft from motor vehicle.  I spoke 
with the vehicle owner, Randy Brown.  He starts that sometime between 1930 hours last evening and 0600 this morning, an 
unknown party entered his 2010 Nissan Titan truck and stole his company owned laptop computer and his small orange ledger 
book which contained his personal banking information.

Mr. Brown stated that he does not have the information on the HP laptop computer but will have his corporate office to email me 
that information.  He is clear that information will be added via a supplement report.

R57/D1

status: suspended/inactive.

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

709 Broad St16-125689 12/5/2016   8:30:00PM 23D THEFT FROM BUILDINGS

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

4000  Rossville BLVD16-125690 12/6/2016   2:30:00PM 13A AGGRAVATED ASSAULT

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         no

17200 I-24 Eastbound16-125707 12/6/2016   2:35:00PM 23E THEFT FROM COIN-OPERATED 

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

599 Cranberry Way16-125729 12/6/2016   3:00:00PM 23D THEFT FROM BUILDINGS

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

25 herokee Blvd16-125733 12/6/2016   3:20:00PM 240 MOTOR VEHICLE THEFT



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

2626 Walker Rd16-125753 12/6/2016   2:30:00PM 13B SIMPLE ASSAULT

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         No

2009 Camden Street16-125775 12/6/2016   5:40:00PM 13A AGGRAVATED ASSAULT

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         yes

211 N Seminole Dr16-125782 12/6/2016   6:20:00PM Miscellaneous

On 12-6-16 at about 1820 hours I, Officer J. Creekmur 715, responded to an open door at 211  N Seminole Rd. Upon arrival police 
found the door open with no signs of forced entry and checked the residence. No one was inside police closed the door and left the
scene. A neighbor had called it in it and said they saw a white male leaving the area.

D2/R54

5960 Shallowford RD16-125787 12/5/2016   6:00:00PM 240 MOTOR VEHICLE THEFT

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

917 Tetra CT16-125823 12/6/2016   6:30:00AM 23H ALL OTHER LARCENY

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

4321 Howell AVE16-125826 12/4/2016   4:00:00AM 100 KIDNAPPING/ABDUCTION

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         No



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

6830 McCutcheon RD16-125835 12/6/2016  11:00:00AM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

22 S. Germantown Rd.16-125837 12/6/2016   9:17:00PM 290 DESTRUCTIVE/DAMAGE/VANDA

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

615 W 13th St Ct16-125839 12/6/2016   9:30:00PM 290 DESTRUCTIVE/DAMAGE/VANDA

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

1800 E 21st ST16-125848 12/6/2016   9:40:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

7796 E Brainerd RD16-125868 12/6/2016  11:40:00PM 250 FORGERY/COUNTERFEITING

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

4942 Sarasota DR16-125932 12/6/2016  10:00:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

131 E 3rd16-125955 12/6/2016   7:00:00PM 23D THEFT FROM BUILDINGS

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

3131 Mountain Creek Rd16-125973 12/7/2016   2:45:00AM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

1012 Farimont Ave16-125985 12/7/2016   1:00:00AM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

7407 Igou Gap rd16-126011 12/7/2016  12:52:00PM Miscellaneous

Responded to this location on a call of found property.  The complainant left the scene prior to police arrival.  I located the items 
and was unable to make contact with the owner.  The items were turned into property under #16-4852.  

D-2/R-57

4605 Kemp Dr16-126073 12/7/2016   4:30:00PM Miscellaneous

On 12/7/2016 at approximately 1630 hours, police responded to 25 S Germantown Rd, Apt 239 in response to a miscellaneous 
complaint. Upon arrival, police met with the complainant, Ms. Caroline Capers, who wanted to inform police that someone was still 
messing with her mailbox located at 4605 Kemp Dr.  

No suspect information and no damage to report.

D2/R54

Charlie South

2100  Hamilton Place BLVD.16-126097 12/7/2016   4:00:00PM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

606 Sylvan ST16-126101 12/7/2016   5:45:00PM 13B SIMPLE ASSAULT

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         No

5579 Hwy 15316-126118 12/7/2016   6:00:00PM 23C SHOPLIFTING

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

8614 Iris Rd.16-126126 12/7/2016   6:55:00PM Suspicious Activity

On 12/7/16 at approx. 1855 hrs, Officers responded to 8614 Iris Road to suspicious activity. Upon arrival, Officers spoke to Andrew 
Hilton (complainant) who said he observed a white Chevy Impala parked in the front of his residence in the roadway. He said as he
was watching he saw a black male run from a house on Flowerdale Drive with a bag of what appeared to be items. He said the 
black male ran from the residence and jumped into the vehicle as it sped off. He believes that type of action is suspicous because 
he has not seen the vehicle before and it had a person running into a house on another street. Officers located the residence that 
the man appeared to come out of which is 8642 Flowerdale Drive. Officers were not able to get anyone to answer the door and 
there appeared to be no forced entry.

D2/R57 Charlie 8

4711 Colonial Dr16-126129 12/7/2016  12:00:00AM 290 DESTRUCTIVE/DAMAGE/VANDA

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         no

3822 Montview Dr16-126178 12/7/2016  10:35:00PM Miscellaneous

Police responded to 3822 Montview Dr Apt 4 in regards to a disorder.  On arrival, Police spoke to a Mr. Robert Peck and a Ms. 
Tara Thomas.  They were engaged in a verbal disorder and Police appeared to have calmed the situation for the night. 

D2/R54

312 Guild Dr16-126194 12/8/2016  12:15:00AM Missing Person



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         no

7051 McCutcheon Rd.16-126221 12/8/2016   4:05:00AM Miscellaneous

On 12/8/16 at 0405 hrs. I responded to a Miscellaneous call at Country Suites at 7051  McCutcheon Rd. Willis Newby reported that 
a female was asleep in the bathroom. He said she had come in a acted like she had a room there. When we checked the 
bathrooms they were all empty. I asked Newby to call us back if she returns. 

D2/ R57
Charlie 9

1185 Mtn Creek Rd16-126223 12/8/2016   5:38:00AM Miscellaneous

On 12-8-16 around 0454 hours I Ofc. Allison was dispatched to 1185 Mtn Creek Rd on a disorder. On scene I made contact with 
complainant Victoria Girder and Joshua Ferriera. Mr. Ferriera was intoxicated and causing a disorder at Ms. Girders residence. I 
had Mr. Ferriera contact a sober driver to come pick him up. Mr. Ferrieras mother came and picked him up. No further police 
action taken.

D2/R51

108 WOODVALE AVE16-126243 12/8/2016   7:20:00AM 240 MOTOR VEHICLE THEFT

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         N

2718 12TH AVE16-126268 12/8/2016   9:11:00AM 290 DESTRUCTIVE/DAMAGE/VANDA

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         NO

1005  Hixson PIKE16-126284 12/7/2016   2:02:00PM 23H ALL OTHER LARCENY

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

622 Chestnut St16-126325 12/8/2016   8:23:00AM Miscellaneous



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

On 08 Dec. 2016, I, PST Glenn, responded via telephone to the office of Daniel White, Attorney at law at 633 Chestnut St., on 
report of a voice mail message that caused him concern.

Mr. White says the message was directed to him personally by name and said that someone was at an address shutting up to 
hurry before someone gets hurt.   Mr. White sent an email with the message attached.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/images/cleardot.gif

R18/D2

2473 5TH AV CT16-126326 12/7/2016   5:00:00PM 23D THEFT FROM BUILDINGS

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         NO

3400 Plummwood Rd16-126331 12/8/2016   1:30:00PM 290 DESTRUCTIVE/DAMAGE/VANDA

Is the incident Gang Related? Yes or No:         unknown

3611 3rd Ave16-126338 12/8/2016   2:37:00PM Miscellaneous

On 12-08-2016 1437 hours, I, Officer T.Barnes #269, responded to 3611 3rd Ave and spoke with Brenda Cosby and Gercara 
Robinson.  According to Mrs. Cosby, Kobeai Ford, called her residence on this date wanting to speak with Ms. Robinson.  Ms. 
Robinson explained that Mr. Ford was her ex-boyfriend and that she wanted nothing to do with him.  Mr. Ford became angry and 
stated that he would come over to Mrs. Cosby's residence.  Mrs. Cosby told him that she would be calling the police.  Mr. Ford 
never responded to the residence, however, the ladies wished to document the incident.  inactive R-56 D-2

900 Mtn Creek Rd16-126349 12/8/2016   3:15:00PM Miscellaneous

Responded to 900 Mtn Creek Rd apt R-319 speaking with Tristan Shappy.  Shappy reports observing two unknown white males 
around the "T" building opening a package and removing the contents from it.  Shappy believes these subjects removed 
someone's delivered package from their doorway for the purpose of stealing the contents.  An opened and damaged box was 
found in breezeway by Signal View Security but it's unclear at this time if this is the same package.  Security is attempting to locate
the owner of this package to determine if a theft or vandalism occurred.
At this time I have no known victim or known suspects.  The males were seen leaving in a black Ford F150 TN plate  
driven by unknown white female.  Tag was registered to Lisa Arrington of Bay Hill Dr., Hixson TN.  No further info at this time.
D2/R08

106 Marlboro Ave16-126435 12/8/2016   7:17:00PM Suspicious Activity

The complainant (Valerie Lee) said that she was driving down Brainerd Rd and a strange car (silver Honda, Tn Plate ) 
was following behind her.  She then turned down the street (Marlboro Ave) where she lives, but the car continued following her.  
She did not go all the way home, but stopped in order to try to make the strange car go around.  Instead the driver (possibly white 
male) pulled up beside her and appeared to be taking her picture and then drove off.  She then followed the car for a little ways 
and was able to the get the plate number.  She said that she has no idea what the incident was all about, but she would like to do a
report for suspicious activity.  This report was taken by phone.  Date: 12/8/16, Time: 19:17.  R54, D2

408 Booth Road16-126587 12/9/2016   9:48:00AM Disorder



12/4/2016  12:00:34AM TO 12/10/2016  12:00:34AM

Police responded to a disorder at 408 Booth Road.  Upon arrival police spoke with Dashun Green (complainant).  The complainant 
stated Cynthia Green was not welcome at her house.  Police transported Cynthia Green to her home address.  Nothing further to 
report.

R- 54/ D- 2 Charlie 2

4107 Fagan St16-126864 12/9/2016  11:45:00PM Miscellaneous

On 12-09-2016 at 2350 police responded to 4107 A Fagan St regarding a disorder. Upon arrival, police made contact with the 
complainant, Perry Mcdonald. He informed police that Brooke Cates was there earlier causing a disorder and throwing things. Ms. 
Cates was gone upon police arrival. Police informed Mr. Mcdonald that he could evict Ms. Cates if he wanted a more permanent 
solution. Nothing further to report at this time. 

D2
R53

6231 Perimeter Dr16-127061 12/8/2016   6:00:00PM Miscellaneous

On 12/10/16 at 1709 hours I Officer Harrison spoke with a Ms. Whitney Harvey, who works at the Red Wing Store at 6231  
Perimeter Dr. Ms. Harvey stated that on 12/8/16 while she was attempting to close the store, an older white male named Steve 
Traylor, asked her to have dinner with him. Ms. Harvey state that she told him no and that he continued to ask her out and follow 
her around the store. She then told him that she had to close the store. the Steve party then waited in his vehicle for about 30 
minutes then drove around the lot very slowly before finally leaving. Ms. Harvey stated that the older man scared her and that she 
felt threatened and wanted the incident documented. No further action.

R54/D2
Charlie 4

1201 Normal Ave16-127267 12/9/2016   9:00:00AM 23F THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

Is this incident GANG RELATED? Yes or No?:         No

Week of 12-4-16 through 12-10-16




